Bid Tabulation
Supply and Deliver Liquid Asphalt Products in Yavapai County, Arizona - Contract #2509312
Effective June 1, 2025 through November 30, 2025

VENDOR

Cactus Asphalt

Earth Resources

Corporation
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

AC15-5TR FOB PerTon | § 694.00( $ 682.00
AC15-5TR Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Prescott Roads PerTon | § 772.00| $ 722.00
AC15-5TR Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Verde Roads Per Ton | § 772.00( $ 722.00
AC15-5TR Delivered and Pumped outside the 50 mile radius PerTon | § 784.00| $ 732.00
ACI15-5TR Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Prescott Roads Per Ton | $ 1,027.00| $ 767.00
AC15-5TR Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Verde Roads Per Ton | $ 1,027.00| $ 772.00
AC15-5TR Delivered and Spread outside the 50 mile radius Per Ton | $ 1,058.00| $ 782.00
CRS-2 FOB PerTon | § 649.00( $ 638.00
CRS-2 Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Prescott Roads PerTon | § 717.00| $ 678.00
CRS-2 Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Verde Roads Per Ton | $ 717.00( $ 678.00
CRS-2 Delivered and Pumped outside the 50 mile radius PerTon | § 727.00| $ 688.00
CRS-2 Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Prescott Roads Per Ton | $ 986.00[ $ 723.00
CRS-2 Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Verde Roads PerTon | § 986.00| $ 728.00
CRS-2 Delivered and Spread outside the 50 mile radius Per Ton | $ 1,017.00| $ 738.00
CRS-2P FOB PerTon | § 660.00( $ 715.00
CRS-2P Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Prescott Roads PerTon | § 728.00| $ 755.00
CRS-2P Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Verde Roads Per Ton | § 728.00( $ 755.00
CRS-2P Delivered and Pumped outside the 50 mile radius PerTon | § 739.00| $ 765.00
CRS-2P Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Prescott Roads Per Ton | $ 962.00( $ 800.00
CRS-2P Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Verde Roads PerTon | § 962.00| $ 805.00
CRS-2P Delivered and Spread outside the 50 mile radius Per Ton | § 994.00( $ 815.00
MC-250 FOB PerTon | § 1,511.00{ $ 1,025.00
MC-250 Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Prescott Roads Per Ton | $ 1,579.00| $ 1,065.00
MC-250 Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Verde Roads Per Ton | $ 1,579.00| $ 1,065.00
MC-250 Delivered and Pumped outside the 50 mile radius Per Ton | $ 1,589.00| $ 1,075.00
MC-250 Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Prescott Roads Per Ton | $ 1,813.00] $ 1,110.00
MC-250 Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Verde Roads Per Ton | $ 1,813.00| $ 1,115.00
MC-250 Delivered and Spread outside the 50 mile radius Per Ton | § 1,844.00| $ 1,125.00

Concentrate | Diluted 1:1 | Concentrate | Diluted 1:1
PASS-R FOB PerTon | § 784.00] No Bid $ 840.00] $ 462.00
PASS-R Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Prescott Roads PerTon | $§ 872.00] No Bid $ 880.00 $ 502.00
PASS-R Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Verde Roads PerTon | § 872.00] No Bid $ 880.00] $§ 502.00
PASS-R Delivered and Pumped outside the 50 mile radius PerTon | $§ 885.00] No Bid $ 890.00l $ 512.00
PASS-R Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Prescott Roads Per Ton | § 1,143.00/ No Bid $ 925.00] $ 547.00
PASS-R Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Verde Roads Per Ton | $ 1,143.00] No Bid $ 935.00] $ 557.00
PASS-R Delivered and Spread outside the 50 mile radius Per Ton | § 1,174.00] No Bid $ 940.00 $ 562.00

Concentrate | Diluted 1:1 | Concentrate | Diluted 1:1
PASS-CR FOB PerTon | § 840.00] No Bid $ 840.001 $ 462.00
PASS-CR Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Prescott Roads Per Ton | § 928.00] No Bid $ 880.00] $§ 502.00
PASS-CR Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Verde Roads PerTon | § 928.00] No Bid $ 880.00] $§ 502.00
PASS-CR Delivered and Pumped outside the 50 mile radius PerTon | $§ 941.00] No Bid $ 890.00 $ 512.00
PASS-CR Delivered and Broom-Spread within 50 miles of Prescott Roads| Per Ton | $ 1,199.00] No Bid $ 925.00] $§ 547.00
PASS-CR Delivered and Broom-Spread within 50 miles of Verde Roads | Per Ton | $ 1,199.00] No Bid $ 935.00] $§ 557.00
PASS-CR Delivered and Broom-Spread outside the 50 mile radius Per Ton | $§ 1,230.00/ No Bid $ 940.00 $ 562.00

Concentrate | Diluted 1:1 | Concentrate | Diluted 1:1
CSS-1H FOB PerTon | § 649.00] $§ 325.00] $§ 640.00] $§ 352.00
CSS-1H Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Prescott Roads PerTon | § 717.00] $§ 392.00f $§ 680.00] $§ 392.00
CSS-1H Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Verde Roads PerTon | $§ 717.001 $§ 392.00] $§ 680.00] $§ 392.00
CSS-1H Delivered and Pumped outside the 50 mile radius PerTon | § 727.00 $ 403.00f $§ 690.00] $§ 402.00
CSS-1H Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Prescott Roads PerTon | $§ 951.00] $§ 627.00] $§ 725.00] $§ 437.00
CSS-1H Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Verde Roads PerTon | § 951.00] § 627.00f $§ 735.00] $§ 447.00
CSS-1H Delivered and Spread outside the 50 mile radius PerTon | $§ 982.00] $§ 658.00] $§ 740.00] $§ 452.00
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Concentrate | Diluted 1:1 | Concentrate | Diluted 1:1

SS-1H FOB PerTon | § 672.00] $§ 336.00] $§ 600.00] $§ 363.00
SS-1H Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Prescott Roads PerTon | § 739.00 $§ 404.00{ $§ 700.00] $ 403.00
SS-1H Delivered and Pumped within 50 miles of Verde Roads PerTon | $§ 739.00] $§ 404.00] $ 700.00] $§ 403.00
SS-1H Delivered and Pumped outside the 50 mile radius PerTon | § 750.00] $ 414.00{ $§ 710.00] $§ 413.00
SS-1H Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Prescott Roads PerTon | § 974.00] $§ 638.00] $§ 745.00] $§ 448.00
SS-1H Delivered and Spread within 50 miles of Verde Roads PerTon | § 97400/ $§ 638.00f $§ 755.00] $§ 458.00
SS-1H Delivered and Spread outside the 50 mile radius Per Ton | $ 1,005.00] $§ 669.00] $§ 760.00] $§ 463.00
VENDOR ADDED COST FACTOR FOR LOADS UNDER 21 TONS Per Ton | $ 400.00| $ 175.00
DELIVERED AND SPREAD

VENDOR ADDED COST FACTOR FOR LOADS UNDER 24 TONS Per Ton | $ 175.00] $ 150.00
DELIVERED AND PUMPED

STANDBY RATE Per Hour| § 350.00| $ 150.00
SALES TAX RATE FOR PRODUCT DELIVERED & PUMPED 8.60% 6.35%
SALES TAX RATE FOR PRODUCT DELIVERED & SPREAD 4.13% 6.35%
OTHER APPLICABLE TAXES (PLEASE IDENTIFY NAME AND RATE) N/A N/A
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